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Beyond Pascal’s Wager  

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
After fourteen questions answered with the visual help of the cross, one 
might be wondering if God is more than three attributes, particularly 

when the numbered “Wrath of God” Cross in Revelation results with 

seven bowls of God’s wrath instead of happiness.   
 
Is there a risk of losing one’s faith with acceptance of God of Creation 
like unto a cross as the true and complete biblical God of salvation? 
 
Pascal's Wager is named after 17th-century French mathematician, physi-
cist, and philosopher Blaise Pascal. The point of Pascal's wager is that 
one cannot come to the knowledge of God’s existence using reasonable 
speculation alone. So the wise thing to do is to live one's life as if God 
exists, because one has nothing to lose and everything to gain.  
 
According to Pascal’s Wager if one lives as though God exists, and God 
does exist, one gains afterlife. If God doesn’t exist, one loses nothing.  
 
However, if one lives as though God does not exist and God really does 
exist, one ends up in hell, and has lost afterlife in heaven. Considering 
the two choices, the rational choice is to live as if God exists. 
 
Farquhar's Wager is named after American Bible mathematician, theolo-
gian, engineer and author JW Farquhar. The point of Farquhar's wager is 
that one can come to the knowledge of God of Creation using the like-
ness of God’s reason introduced in the Bible’s Creation, validated by 
holy numbers in the Bible and taught by Jesus and Paul. With the four-
fold God of Creation one has nothing to lose and everything to gain. 
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According to Farquhar’s Wager if one believes as though the fourfold  
God of Creation exists, and God of Creation does exist, one gains after-
life. If God of Creation does not exist, a Christian loses nothing, because 
the fourfold God of Creation already includes the Trinity.  
 
However, if a Christian believes God of Creation does not exist and God 
of Creation really does exist, the Christian violates God's first Command-
ment by worshipping a non-biblical, incomplete triune-god, not written 
in any Bible, ends up in hell, and has lost afterlife in heaven.  
 
Considering the two choices, the rational choice is to live as if the bibli-
cal fourfold God of Creation exists and the Doctrine of the Cross is true. 
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